©
CH0g mdeedd
Government of Kerala
i 2020

Regn.No. KERBIL/2012/45073
ated 05-09-2012 with RNI

" Reg No.KI/TV(N)/634/2018-20

KERALA GAZETTE
@GRMVIWIOMo

EXTRAORDINARY
@Wwle0)e0Iw (I evensyomymaer
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORIT_Y
o)DMy o, - 2020 amaus 06
- ol 06;h January 2020
r;:zla:‘%xs : 1195 wm; 21 m“N”f 38
: Thiruvananthapuram, - 7, 18t Dhanu 1195 :
Monday » 1941 1Yo 16

lﬁah Pousha (94|

GOVERNMENT OF KERALA

Labour and Skills (E) Department

NOTIFICATION

LBRD-E3/128/2017-LBR ' Dated, Thiruvananthapuram, 4" January, 2020
19 Dhanu 1195,

The following draft Regulations further to amend the Kerala Trade Union

Regulations, 1958 which Government of Kerala proposcs to make in cxercise of the powers conferred

by sub-subsection (1) of section 29 of the Indian Trade Unions Act, 1926 (Central Act XVI of 1926) are

~ hereby published as required by sub-scction (1) of scction 30 of the said Act for general information of
all persons likely to be affected. o ' :

Notice is hercby given that the said draft will be taken up for consideration on or after three
months form the date of publication of this notification in the Gazette and that objections and
suggestions, if any, that may be reccived from any person with respect to the said proposal on or before
the date specified above, will be considered by the Government. All objections and suggestions shall be

This is a digitally signed Gazette, .
Authenticity may be verified through https:/fcomposc kerala.gov.in/




addressed to the Additional Chief Seccretary to chcmmem, Labour and Skills (E) Departmnt .
_ i

Government Secretariat, Thiruvananthapuram - 695 001.

DRAFT REGULATIONS

/. Short title and commencement.-(1) These regulations may be called the Keraa Tradc
Umons(Amendmcm) Regu!atlons 2019.
(2) They shall come into forcc at once.

2. Amendment of the chu/ations. -In the Kerala Trade Union Regulations, 1958, .
(1) n regulation 3A, for the words “sixty days”, the words “thirty days” shall be substituted, *
- (2) after regulation 4, the following regulation shall be inserted namely:- ¥
“4A. Time limit for registration.- Every application duly submitied for regastrahon of a
trade union in accordance with section 5 shall be disposed within 30 days” : :
(3) in rcgulanon 5, for the words “one thousand rupees”, thc words ‘ten thousand mpees sha
be substituted; :

{
(4) in clause 3 of regulation 17, in item (ii), for the words “two hundred and fifty rupees”, the
words “five hundred rupees’ shall be substituted. : !

(5) in rcgulauon 27.-
(a) in clause (i) for the words “Naya paise fifty”, the words
“Rupees tcn only”, shall be substituted:

(b) in clause (ii) for the words “Naya paise fifty”, thc words
“Rupces ten only” shall be substituted.

By order of the Governor,
~ SATYAJEET RAJAN
Additional Chief Secretary to Government

PUBLISHED BY THE SUPERINTENDENT Cl- GOVERNMENT PRESS

Thcs isa dnytally signed Gazctte.

o Ly e AN B CRLTs WL SIS ) IS TRt ol et Wi, o e iy | e PG A MG TR e D R

1

AT THE GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, THIRUVANANTHAPURAM, 2020 MG Dighally signdd by SHEELA '
%f Da10:2020.01:06 07:28:10
fole 2A



